W91QUZ-06-D-0007

SOLICITATION/CONTRACT/ORDER FOR COMMERCIAL ITEMS hf‘;‘%ﬁ:?gg’:{)@“mm PAGE1OF 524
OFFEROR TO COMPLETE BLOCKS 12, 17, 23, 24, AND 30
2. CONTRACT NO. 3. AWARD/EFFECTIVE DATE 4. ORDER NUMBER 5. SOLICITATION NUMBER 6. SOLICITATION ISSUE DATE
W91QUZ-06-D-0007-P00014 24-Apr-2006 W91QUZ-05-R-0011 21-Oct-2005
7. FOR SOLICITATION a. NAME b. TELEPHONE NUMBER  (No Collect Calls) 8. OFFER DUE DATE/LOCAL TIME
INFORMATION CALL: WANDA S. DIXON 703-325-9507 02:00 PM 28 Nov 2005

9. ISSUED BY CODE | wo1QUZ 10. THIS ACQUISITION IS 11. DELIVERY FOR FOB |12. DISCOUNT TERMS
ARMY CONTRACTING AGENCY-ITECA UNRESTRICTED DESTINATION UNLESS
2461 EISENHOWER AVE l SET ASIDE: % FOR BLOCK IS MARKED
ALEXANDRIA VA 22331-1700 |:| SEE SCHEDULE

SMALL BUSINESS

HUBZONE SMALL BUSINESS |:| 13a. THIS CONTRACT IS A RATED ORDER

UNDER DPAS (15 CFR 700)
8(A)
13b. RATING
TEL: NAICS: 334111 14. METHOD OF SOLICITATION
EAX: SIZE STANDARD: 1000 DRFQ |:||FB RFP
15. DELIVER TO CODE 16. ADMINISTERED BY CODE |
SEE SCHEDULE SEE ITEM 9
17a.CONTRACTOR/OFFEROR CODE | 3Y916 18a. PAYMENT WILL BE MADE BY CODE
EMTEC FEDERAL INC TO BE SPECIFIED ON EACH ORDER
MARK L FERTIK AS ADDRESSED
11 DIAMOND RD CONUS AND OCONUS AA
SPRINGFIELD NJ 07081-3101
FACILITY
TEL. CODE
17b. CHECK IF REMITTANCE IS DIFFERENT AND PUT 18b. SUBMIT INVOICES TO ADDRESS SHOWN IN BLOCK 18a. UNLESS BLOCK
SUCH ADDRESS IN OFFER BELOW IS CHECKED SEE ADDENDUM

19. ITEM NO. 20. SCHEDULE OF SUPPLIES/ SERVICES

21. QUANTITY [ 22. UNIT |23. UNIT PRICE [ 24. AMOUNT

SEE SCHEDULE

25. ACCOUNTING AND APPROPRIATION DATA

See Schedule

26. TOTAL AWARD AMOUNT (For Govt. Use Only)

$92,891.00

|:| 27a. SOLICITATION INCORPORATES BY REFERENCE FAR 52.212-1. 52.212-4. FAR 52.212-3.

|:| 27b. CONTRACT/PURCHASE ORDER INCORPORATES BY REFERENCE FAR 52.212-4. FAR 52.212-5 IS ATTACHED.

52.212-5 ARE ATTACHED. ADDENDA |:|ARE |:|ARE NOT ATTACHED

ADDENDA |:|ARE |:|ARE NOT ATTACHED

28. CONTRACTOR IS REQUIRED TO SIGN THIS DOCUMENT AND RETURN

]

0 COPIES
TO ISSUING OFFICE. CONTRACTOR AGREES TO FURNISH AND DELIVER ALL ITEMS
SET FORTH OR OTHERWISE IDENTIFIED ABOVE AND ON ANY ADDITIONAL SHEETS
SUBJECT TO THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS SPECIFIED HEREIN.

29. AWARD OF CONTRACT: REFERENCE Westwood Computer's Proposal

OFFER DATED 28-Nov-2005 . YOUR OFFER ON SOLICITATION
(BLOCK 5), INCLUDING ANY ADDITIONS OR CHANGES WHICH ARE

SET FORTH HEREIN, IS ACCEPTED AS TO ITEMS: SEE SCHEDULE

30a. SIGNATURE OF OFFEROR/CONTRACTOR

3la. UN TED STATES OF AMER CA

(SIGNATURE OF CONTRACTING OFFICER) [31c. DATE SI G\ED

24- Apr - 2006

30b. NAME AND TITLE OF SIGNER
(TYPE OR PRINT)

30c. DATE SIGNED

31b. NAME CF QONTRACTI NG CFFI CER (TYPE OR PRI NT)
VALERIE M LLS / QONTRACTI NG CFFI CER

TEL: 703-325-3348

EMAIL: valerie.mml|s@s.arny.nil

AUTHORIZED FOR LOCAL REPRODUCTION
PREVIOUS EDITION IS NOT USABLE

STANDARD FORM 1449 (REV 4/2002)

Prescribed by GSA

FAR (48 CFR) 53.212



W91QUZ-06-D-0007

SOLICITATION/CONTRACT/ORDER FOR COMMERCIAL ITEMS PAGE 2 OF 524
(CONTINUED)
19. TEM NO. 20. SCHEDULE OF SUPPLIES/ SERVICES 21. QUANTITY 22. UNIT | 23. UNIT PRICE 24, AMOUNT
SEE SCHEDULE

32a. QUANTITY IN COLUMN 21 HAS BEEN

|:| RECEIVED |:|INSPECTED |:|
ACCEPTED, AND CONFORMS TO THE CONTRACT, EXCEPT AS NOTED:

32b. SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED GOVERNMENT 32c. DATE 32d. PRINTED NAME AND TITLE OF AUTHORIZED GOVERNMENT
REPRESENTATIVE REPRESENTATIVE
32e. MAILING ADDRESS OF AUTHORIZED GOVERNMENT REPRESENTATIVE 32f. TELEPHONE NUMBER OF AUTHORIZED GOVERNMENT REPRESENTATIVE

32g. E-MAIL OF AUTHORIZED GOVERNMENT REPRESENTATIVE

33. SHIP NUMBER 34. VOUCHER NUMBER 35. AMOUNT VERIFIED 36. PAYMENT 37. CHECK NUMBER
CORRECT FOR

|:| COMPLETE |:| PARTIAL |:| FINAL
| PARTIAL | |FINAL

38. SIR ACCOUNT NUMBER |39. S/R VOUCHER NUMBER [40. PAID BY

4la. | CERTIFY THIS ACCOUNT IS CORRECT AND PROPER FOR PAYMENT [ 42a. RECEIVED BY (Print)
41b. SIGNATURE AND TITLE OF CERTIFYING OFFICER 41c. DATE
42b. RECEIVED AT (Location)
42c. DATE REC'D (YY/MM/DD) 42d. TOTAL CONTAINERS
AUTHORIZED FOR LOCAL REPRODUCTION STANDARD FORM 1449 (REV 4/2002) BACK
PREVIOUS EDITION IS NOT USABLE Prescribed by GSA

FAR (48 CFR) 53.212



W91QUZ-06-D-0007

Section SF 30 - BLOCK 14 CONTINUATION PAGE

CONTINUATION PAGE

A. Add the Consolidated Buy-9 Desktops, Notebooks, and Monitors CLINs 0920AA-0920AN, 0921AA-0921AQ,
0923AA- 0923AW, 0924AA- 0924AV, 0925AA- 0925AV, 0926AA- 0926AV, 0927AA-0927AB, 0928AA-
0928AB and Incorporate the Consolidated Buy-9 Specification and Pricing Spreadsheets as attached.

B. Upon acceptance of this modification, the contractor agrees to the placement of the modification on the Army
Computer Hardware, Enterprise Software and Solutions (CHESS) website.

C. Updates Part C. 4, Consolidated Buy Terms and Conditions.

D. Incorporates Contract Change Requests (CCR) 0005 all additions and deletions proposed under CCRs, having
previously approved, are hereby incorporated under part C.2 (r)

E. All other terms and conditions remain unchanged

CONTINUATION PAGE

The purpose of this modification is to:

A. Add the Consolidated Buy-10 Desktops, Notebooks, and Monitors CLINS 1010AA-1010AQ, 1011AA-
1011AS, 1013AA- 1013AS, 1014AA-1014AY, 1015AA-1015A X, 1016AA-1016AX, 1017AA-
1017AX, 1018AA-1018AC, 1019AA-1019AC and Incorporate the Consolidated Buy-10 Specification
and Pricing Spreadsheets as attached

B. Upon acceptance of this modification, the contractor agrees to the placement of the modification on the
Army Computer Hardware, Enterprise Software and Solutions (CHESS) website

C. Update Part A, paragraph A.1, Government’s Contract Administration

D. Update Part C.4, paragraph 3, Consolidated Buy Terms and Conditions

E. Update Part C.2 (j)(2) and (u)(9), ADDENDUM TO FAR 52.212-4 SPECIAL PROVISIONS
F. Update Part D-1, paragraph 5, Constraints

G. Update Part. D-1, Attachment A, Reports

H. Incorporate Contract Change Request (CCR) R-0007, all additions and deletions proposed
under the CCR, having previously been approved, are hereby incorporated under part C.2 (r)

I. All other terms and conditions remain unchanged



W91QUZ-06-D-0007

Section SF 1449 - CONTINUATION SHEET

PART A
TABLE OF CONTENTS
PART DESCRIPTION
PART A: SF1449

SF1449 Solicitation/Contract/Order for Commercial Items Cover Sheet
A Table of Contents

Continuation of Standard Form 1449

PART B: SCHEDULE OF SUPPLIES

B Part B CLIN List and Pricing Terms

PART C: CLAUSES
C Clauses, Special Provisions and Addendum

PART D: STATEMENT OF WORK AND ATTACHMENTS

D.1 ADMC-2 Statement of Work (SOW)
Attachment A Contract Reports

Equipment Failure

Order Transaction (OT)

Vendor Status (VS)

IT E-mart Online Catalog Product Attributes (PA) Information Sheet

Product Attributes (PA)
Attachment B DD Form 254, DOD Contract Security Classification Specification
Attachment C Westwood - Final Proposal Revision, Mission Support, Volume |, Section 1- Business Processes

Westwood - Final Proposal Revision, Mission Support, Volume |, Section
2 - Module 1 Quality Cert

Westwood - Final Proposal Revision ,Mission Support, Volume |, Section 3 - Module 2 Quality Cert

Westwood - Final Proposal Revision ,Mission Support, Volume |, Section 4 - Business Management




W91QUZ-06-D-0007

Continuation of SF1449
Part A
Addendum to Standard Form 1449

A.1 Government’s Contract Administration:

The basic contract will be administered by the office indicated in SF1449, Block 9. Individua orderswill be

administered as designated in the order.

ITEC4 Contracting Office:

Contracting Officer
E-mail address:
Telephone number:

Contract Specialist:
E-mail address:
Telephone number:

Ombudsman:
E-mail address:
Telephone number:

Valerie M. Mills
valerie.m.mills@us.army.mil
703-325-3348

Erin Fox-Ramirez
erin.foxramirez@us.army.mil
703 325-5767

Stephen Carrano
stephen.carrano@us.army.mil
703-325-9760

A2 Army Chess Computer Hardware, Enterprise Software and Solutions (Chess):

Contracting Officer’s Representative:
E-mail address:
Telephone number:

A.3 Contractor’s Contract Administration:

Contractor’ s Administration Office:

Point of contact:

Joan Pesanello
joan.pesanello@us.army.mil
732-427-6784

Emtec Federal, Inc
11 Diamond Road
Springfield, NJ 07081

Andre L. Richmond

DoD Program Manager
andrerichmond@emtecinc.com
(703)961 1125 x224



mailto:andrerichmond@emtecinc.com

W91QUZ-06-D-0007

A.4 Authorized Contractor Representative:
(Contractual Binding/Negotiation Authority)

Name and Title Ron Seitz
President, Emtec Systems

ronaldseitz@emtecinc.com
770-904-0611 Ext.319

Jeff Posey

Vice President Federal Sales
Ph 571-299-1342

jeff posey @emtecinc.com

David Micaes
VP Operations
davidmicales@emtecinc.com
973-376-4242

A.5 Remittance Address (SF1449, Block 17b):
Emtec Federa Inc
P.O. Box 8500 (S-42005)
Philadelphia, PA 19178

Electronic Funds Transfer (EFT) payment shall be made asfollows:

Financial institution address:
WachoviaBank N.A.

1525 West W.T. Harris Blvd.
Charlotte, NC 28262

Routing transit number: A/C 2014126497248

Depositor account number: ABA: 021200025
ACH Coordinator: Cathy Huntley
Telephone Number: 908-598-3856
Vendor Contact: Tom Duda, CFO
Tax ID: 22-191-3563



mailto:ronaldseitz@emtecinc.com
mailto:davidmicales@emtecinc.com

W91QUZ-06-D-0007

A.6 Invoice Submittal Address (SF 1449, Block 18B):

The address for invoice submission shall be identified on each individual order. Invoice submission shall bein
accordance with the respective “Invoice’ clause asidentified in the individual order.

A7 Payment Office (SF1449, Block 18a):

The payment office shall be identified on each individual order. The procedures for payment shall be in accordance
with the respective " Payment” clause, asidentified in the individual order.

Contract Minimum Payment Officeis:
DFAS-SL-AQOD

4300 Goodfellow Blvd, Bldg 110

PO Box 200009

St Louis, Mo 63120-0009



ITEM NO SUPPLIES/'SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE MAX AMOUNT

0001

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
Page 8 of 524

CONTINUATION PAGE
The purpose of this modification isto:

A. Add the Consolidated Buy-8 Desktops, Notebooks, and Monitors CLINs 0910AA-0910AN, 0911AA-0911AQ,
0913AA- 0913AV, 0914AA- 0914AU, 0915AA- 0915AT, 0916AA- 0916AS, 0917AA-0917AB, 0918AA-0918AB
and Incorporate the Consolidated Buy-8 Specification and Pricing Spreadsheets as attached.

B. Upon acceptance of this modification, the contractor agrees to the placement of the modification on the Army
Computer Hardware, Enterprise Software and Solutions (CHESS) website.

C. Updates Part C. 4, Consolidated Buy Terms and Conditions.

D. Incorporates Contract Change Request (CCR) 0004 all additions and deletions proposed under CCR, having
previously approved, are hereby incorporated under part C.2 (r)

E. All other terms and conditions remain unchanged.

QUANTITY
$0.00

Guaranteed Minimum
FFP
The gauranteed minimum amount is $2,500 for this contract. The minimum
applies only to the Base Period.
FOB: Destination
PURCHASE REQUEST NUMBER: MIPR6AITCSC003

MAX
NET AMT

ACRN AA
CIN: 000000000000000000000000000000



ITEM NO

0002

ITEM NO

0003
EXERCISED
OPTION

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
1 Lot UNDEFINED
Base Period - (CLINs 1001-1700)
FFP

The Period of Performanceis 24 April 2006 TO 23 April 2009
FOB: Destination

MAX
NET AMT
SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
1 Lot UNDEFINED
1st Two Year Option (CLINs2001-2700)
FFP
The Period of Performanceis 24 April 2009 TO 23 April 2011
FOB: Destination
MAX

NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
Page 9 of 524

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



ITEM NO

0004
OPTION

ITEM NO

0005
OPTION

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
1 Lot UNDEFINED
2nd Two Y ear Option (CLINs 3001-3700)
FFP

The Period of Performanceis 24 April 2011 TO 23 April 2013
FOB: Destination

MAX
NET AMT
SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
1 Lot UNDEFINED
3rd Two Y ear Option (CLINs 4001-4700)
FFP
The Period of Performanceis 24 April 2013 TO 23 April 2015
FOB: Destination
MAX

NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
Page 10 of 524

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



ITEM NO

0006
OPTION

ITEM NO

0710

ITEM NO

0710AA

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
1 Lot UNDEFINED
One-Year Option (CLINs5001-5700)
FFP

The Period of Performanceis 24 April 2015 TO 23 April 2016
FOB: Destination

MAX
NET AMT
SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
UNDEFINED Each UNDEFINED
SMALL FORM FACTOR (CB-4)
FFP
FOB: Destination
MAX
NET AMT
SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
1 Each $778.00
CONUS
FFP
FOB: Destination
MAX

NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
Page 11 of 524

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$778.00

$778.00



ITEM NO

0710AB

ITEM NO

0710AC

ITEM NO

0710AD

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
OCONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
2 GB Memory Upgrade (Options)
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
160 GB HDD Upgrade
FFP
FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$873.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$105.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
Page 12 of 524

MAX AMOUNT

$873.00

$873.00

MAX AMOUNT

$105.00

$105.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



ITEM NO

0710AE

ITEM NO

0710AF

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

USB to Serial Adapter
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

USB to Parallel Adapter
FFP
FOB: Destination

MAX
QUANTITY
1

MAX
QUANTITY
1

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
Page 13 of 524

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



ITEM NO

0710AG

ITEM NO

0710AH

ITEM NO

0710AJ

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Multimedia Speakers
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
One Y ear Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
One Y ear Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$25.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$123.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$134.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
Page 14 of 524

MAX AMOUNT

$25.00

$25.00

MAX AMOUNT

$123.00

$123.00

MAX AMOUNT

$134.00

$134.00



ITEM NO

0710AK

ITEM NO

0710AL

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Two Y ear Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Two Y ear Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$240.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$255.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
Page 15 of 524

MAX AMOUNT

$240.00

$240.00

MAX AMOUNT

$255.00

$255.00



ITEM NO

0711

ITEM NO

0711AA

ITEM NO

0711AB

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
UNDEFINED

MINI TOWER (CB-4)

FFP

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
CONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/'SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
OCONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$895.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$990.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
Page 16 of 524

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$895.00

$895.00

MAX AMOUNT

$990.00

$990.00



ITEM NO

0711AC

ITEM NO

0711AD

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
1 Each $105.00
2 GB Memory Upgrade (Options)
FFP

This memory configration shall replace standard configuration.

FOB: Destination

MAX
NET AMT
SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
1 Each $305.00

4 GB Memory Upgrade
FFP
This memory configration shall replace standard configuration.
FOB: Destination

MAX

NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
Page 17 of 524

MAX AMOUNT

$105.00

$105.00

MAX AMOUNT

$305.00

$305.00



ITEM NO

0711AE

ITEM NO

0711AF

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
1 Each

160 GB HDD Upgrade
FFP

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

This memory configration shall replace standard configuration.

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
1 Each

Additional 80 GB HDD
FFP
This hard drive complements the base system HDD.

FOB: Destination

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$70.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
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MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$70.00

$70.00



ITEM NO

0711AG

ITEM NO

0711AH

ITEM NO

0711AJ

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

USB to Serial Adapter
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

USB to Parallel Adapter
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

Multimedia Speakers
FFP
FOB: Destination

MAX UNIT

QUANTITY
1 Each
MAX UNIT

QUANTITY
1 Each
MAX UNIT

QUANTITY
1 Each

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$25.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007

(efox103530)
Page 19 of 524

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$25.00

$25.00



ITEM NO

0711AK

ITEM NO

0711AL

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
One Y ear Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
One Y ear Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$123.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$134.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
Page 20 of 524

MAX AMOUNT

$123.00

$123.00

MAX AMOUNT

$134.00

$134.00



ITEM NO

0711AM

ITEM NO

0711AN

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Two Year Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Two Y ear Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$240.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$255.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
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MAX AMOUNT

$240.00

$240.00

MAX AMOUNT

$255.00

$255.00



ITEM NO

0714

ITEM NO

0714AA

ITEM NO

0714AB

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

MAX
QUANTITY
UNDEFINED

MAINSTREAM NOTEBOOK (CB-4)

FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

CONUS
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

OCONUS
FFP
FOB: Destination

MAX
QUANTITY
1

MAX
QUANTITY
1

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$1,646.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$1,767.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
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MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$1,646.00

$1,646.00

MAX AMOUNT

$1,767.00

$1,767.00



ITEM NO SUPPLIES/'SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
0714AC 1 Each $85.00
2 GB Memory Upgrade (Options)
FFP

This memory configration shall replace standard configuration.

FOB: Destination

MAX
NET AMT
ITEM NO SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
0714AD 1 Each UNDEFINED
120 GB HDD Upgrade
FFP
This memory configration shall replace standard configuration.
FOB: Destination
MAX

NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
Page 23 of 524

MAX AMOUNT

$85.00

$85.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



ITEM NO

0714AE

ITEM NO

0714AG

ITEM NO

0714AH

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
1 Each

Add'| 80GB RHDD or External USB Drive

FFP

This hard drive complements the base system HDD.

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

USB to Serial Adapter
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

USB to Parallel Adapter
FFP
FOB: Destination

MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
1 Each
MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
1 Each

UNIT PRICE

$98.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$28.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007

(efox103530)
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MAX AMOUNT

$98.00

$98.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$28.00

$28.00



ITEM NO

0714AJ

ITEM NO

0714AK

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

Docking Station
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

Port Replicator
FFP
FOB: Destination

MAX
QUANTITY
1

MAX
QUANTITY
1

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$165.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$140.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
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MAX AMOUNT

$165.00

$165.00

MAX AMOUNT

$140.00

$140.00



ITEM NO

0714AL

ITEM NO

0714AM

ITEM NO

0714AN

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
1 Each
Carrying Case
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
1 Each
Extra Battery
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
1 Each
One Y ear Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP

(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

$25.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$99.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$274.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
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MAX AMOUNT

$25.00

$25.00

MAX AMOUNT

$99.00

$99.00

MAX AMOUNT

$274.00

$274.00



ITEM NO

0714AP

ITEM NO

0714AQ

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
One Y ear Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Two Y ear Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$339.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$354.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
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MAX AMOUNT

$339.00

$339.00

MAX AMOUNT

$354.00

$354.00



ITEM NO

0714AR

ITEM NO

0715

ITEM NO

0715AA

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Two Y ear Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
UNDEFINED

SPECIALTY NOTEBOOK (CB-4)

FFP

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
CONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$425.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$1,484.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
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MAX AMOUNT

$425.00

$425.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$1,484.00

$1,484.00



ITEM NO

0715AB

ITEM NO

0715AC

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
OCONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
2 GB Memory Upgrade (Options)
FFP

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$1,612.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$100.00

This memory configration shall replace standard configuration.

FOB: Destination

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
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MAX AMOUNT

$1,612.00

$1,612.00

MAX AMOUNT

$100.00

$100.00



ITEM NO

0715AD

ITEM NO

0715AF

ITEM NO

0715AG

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
100 GB HDD Upgrade
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1

Add'l 100 GB RHDD or External USB Drive

FFP

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

This hard drive complements the base system HDD.

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
USB to Serial Adapter
FFP
FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$98.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$25.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$98.00

$98.00

MAX AMOUNT

$25.00

$25.00



ITEM NO

0715AH

ITEM NO

0715AJ

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
USB to Parallel Adapter
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Docking Station
FFP
FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$28.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$165.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
(efox103530)
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MAX AMOUNT

$28.00

$28.00

MAX AMOUNT

$165.00

$165.00



ITEM NO

0715AK

ITEM NO

0715AL

ITEM NO

0715AM

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

Port Replicator
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

Carrying Case
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

Extra Battery
FFP
FOB: Destination

MAX UNIT

QUANTITY
1 Each
MAX UNIT

QUANTITY
1 Each
MAX UNIT

QUANTITY
1 Each

UNIT PRICE

$140.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$75.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$135.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$140.00

$140.00

MAX AMOUNT

$75.00

$75.00

MAX AMOUNT

$135.00

$135.00



ITEM NO

0715AN

ITEM NO

0715AP

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
One Y ear Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
One Y ear Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$274.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$339.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$274.00

$274.00

MAX AMOUNT

$339.00

$339.00



ITEM NO

0715AQ

ITEM NO

0715AR

ITEM NO

0717

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Two Year Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Two Y ear Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
UNDEFINED

19" LCD DISPLAY (CB-4)

FFP

FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$354.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$425.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$354.00

$354.00

MAX AMOUNT

$425.00

$425.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



ITEM NO

0717AA

ITEM NO

0717AB

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

CONUS
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

OCONUS
FFP
FOB: Destination

MAX
QUANTITY
1

MAX
QUANTITY
1

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$225.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$276.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$225.00

$225.00

MAX AMOUNT

$276.00

$276.00



ITEM NO

0718

ITEM NO

0718AA

ITEM NO

0718AB

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

MAX
QUANTITY
UNDEFINED

20" LCD DISPLAY (CB-4)

FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

CONUS
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

OCONUS
FFP
FOB: Destination

MAX
QUANTITY
1

MAX
QUANTITY
1

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

UNDEFINED

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$447.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$505.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$447.00

$447.00

MAX AMOUNT

$505.00

$505.00



ITEM NO

0720

ITEM NO

0720AA

ITEM NO

0720AB

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

Small Form Factor (CB-5)

FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

CONUS
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

OCONUS
FFP
FOB: Destination

MAX
QUANTITY
UNDEFINED

MAX
QUANTITY
1

MAX
QUANTITY
1

UNIT

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$524.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$624.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$524.00

$524.00

MAX AMOUNT

$624.00

$624.00



ITEM NO

0720AC

ITEM NO

0720AD

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
1 Each

2 GB Memory Upgrade
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
1 Each

160 GB HDD Upgrade
FFP

Included in Base System
FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

$78.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$78.00

$78.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



ITEM NO

0720AE

ITEM NO

0720AF

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

RESERVED (No Bid)
FFP
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

Reserved

FFP

No Bid

FOB: Destination

MAX
QUANTITY
1

MAX
QUANTITY
1

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



ITEM NO

0720AG

ITEM NO

0720AH

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
RESERVED
FFP
No Bid

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
One Y ear Extended CONUS Waranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$70.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$70.00

$70.00



ITEM NO

0720AJ

ITEM NO

0720AK

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
One Y ear Extended OCONUS Waranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Two Y ear Extended CONUS Waranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$80.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$130.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$80.00

$80.00

MAX AMOUNT

$130.00

$130.00



ITEM NO

0720AL

ITEM NO

0721

ITEM NO

0721AA

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Two Y ear Extended OCONUS Waranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
UNDEFINED

Mini-Tower (CB-5)

FFP

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
CONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$148.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$627.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$148.00

$148.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$627.00

$627.00



ITEM NO

0721AB

ITEM NO

0721AC

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
1 Each $727.00
OCONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

MAX
NET AMT
SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT UNIT PRICE
QUANTITY
1 Each $78.00
2 GB Memory Upgrade
FFP
This memory configuration shall replace standard configuration
FOB: Destination
MAX

NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$727.00

$727.00

MAX AMOUNT

$78.00

$78.00



ITEM NO

0721AD

ITEM NO

0721AE

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
1 Each

4 GB Memory Upgrade
FFP

UNIT PRICE

$225.00

This memory configuration shall replace standard configuration

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
Each
160 GB HDD Upgrade
FFP
Included in Base System
FOB: Destination

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$225.00

$225.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



ITEM NO

0721AF

ITEM NO

0721AG

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
1 Each

Additional 80 GB HDD

FFP

This hard drive complements the base system HDD
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
1 Each
RESERVED
FFP
No Bid

FOB: Destination

UNIT PRICE

$44.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$44.00

$44.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



ITEM NO

0721AH

ITEM NO

0721AJ

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
RESERVED
FFP
No Bid

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Multimedia Speakers
FFP

FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$21.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$21.00

$21.00



ITEM NO

0721AK

ITEM NO

0721AL

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
One Y ear Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
One Y ear Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$70.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$80.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$70.00

$70.00

MAX AMOUNT

$80.00

$80.00



ITEM NO

0721AM

ITEM NO

0721AN

ITEM NO

0724

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Two Y ear Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Two Y ear Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
UNDEFINED

Mainstream Notebook (CB-5)

FFP

FOB: Destination

UNIT

UNIT

Each

UNIT

UNIT PRICE

$130.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$148.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$130.00

$130.00

MAX AMOUNT

$148.00

$148.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



ITEM NO

0724AA

ITEM NO

0724AB

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
CONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
OCONUS
FFP

FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$1,110.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$1,235.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$1,110.00

$1,110.00

MAX AMOUNT

$1,235.00

$1,235.00



ITEM NO

0724AC

ITEM NO

0724AD

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
1 Each

2 GB Memory Upgrade
FFP

UNIT PRICE

$55.00

This memory configuration shall replace standard configuration

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX UNIT
QUANTITY
1 Each

120 GB HDD Upgrade
FFP

Included in Base System
FOB: Destination

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$55.00

$55.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



ITEM NO

0724AE

ITEM NO

0724AF

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Additional 80GB Removable HDD
FFP
or External USB Drive

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
RESERVED
FFP
No Bid

FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$98.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$98.00

$98.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00



ITEM NO

0724AG

ITEM NO

0724AH

ITEM NO

0724AJ

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

RESERVED
FFP

No Bid

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

RESERVED

FFP

No Bid

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

Docking Station
FFP
FOB: Destination

MAX UNIT

QUANTITY
1 Each
MAX UNIT

QUANTITY
1 Each
MAX UNIT

QUANTITY
1 Each

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$110.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$110.00

$110.00



ITEM NO

0724AK

ITEM NO

0724AL

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

RESERVED

FFP

No Bid

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES

Carrying Case
FFP
FOB: Destination

MAX
QUANTITY
1

MAX
QUANTITY
1

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$0.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$24.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-0007
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MAX AMOUNT

$0.00

$0.00

MAX AMOUNT

$24.00

$24.00



ITEM NO

0724AM

ITEM NO

0724AN

ITEM NO

0724AP

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
Extra Battery
FFP

FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
One Y ear Extended CONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

SUPPLIES/SERVICES MAX
QUANTITY
1
One Y ear Extended OCONUS Warranty
FFP
(IAW ADMC-2 Terms and Conditions)
FOB: Destination

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT

Each

UNIT PRICE

$89.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$170.00

MAX
NET AMT

UNIT PRICE

$196.00

MAX
NET AMT

W91QUZ-06-D-000